
Messenger 

Dear Saints,   

     May is here, spring has sprung, and the kingdom of God continues to move forward. Even like we see in    
nature, right before our very eyes, God is springing forth new growth in His body. We have seen some increase in 
our worship attendance this spring, some folks are joining our church membership, and we are continuing to   
experience the goodness of God in our worship times together. Thank you to everyone for giving sacrificially for 
God’s Kingdom glory. Praise God from whom all blessings flow!  

     We have some abundant opportunities, events, and happenings coming up over the next two or three months, 
that we can all participate in. The more we get together…the more…we get…together! The first Wednesday 
evening of each of the next four months, (May 1st, June 5th, July 3rd, August 7th) we will be hosting “Summer 
Nights on the Lawn” at Memorial. We are going to forego our regular meetings and meet out under the Pavilion 
for fun, food, and fellowship. These fellowship events are designed for everyone to come and spend a little time 
enjoying each other and getting to know one another. We are looking forward to some great times together. I 
hope you will mark these dates on your calendars and plan on coming out to our Bowen Pavilion and enjoying 
“Summer Nights on the Lawn” with us! 

     Coming up quickly on May 1st, we are hosting “Cornhole and Campfire!” Everyone from all age groups are 
welcome to come and join in the fun. You will be able to roast hotdogs and marshmallows (s’mores) over a             
firepit under the pavilion. You may want to bring your own roasting stick or “coat hanger.” HA! We will be            
hosting a cornhole tournament, other yard games, music, along with bubbles and sidewalk chalk for our little 
ones. It will be a fantastic time to hang out together! Come out and join us as we enjoy fellowship and our         
wonderful relationships with the Memorial family!  

       Love God, Love Others, Serve the World! God is on the move and serving up opportunities for us to be  
involved in His kingdom work. Please continue to be in prayer as we seek a new student minister to lead our  
middle and high school students. This is a vital area of ministry in the life of these students and for Memorial. We 
look forward to a great transition toward the person that God has for us to serve beside in this ministry!   

     Now, is the time for each of us to step up, and dive in, getting immersed in God’s Word and work! Let’s go 
make some disciples, fulfilling all that God has for us! I love you, and I believe in you. It is my high and holy  
honor to be called your pastor…the pastor of Memorial Baptist Church. God is so good! 

 Your co-laborer in ministry and the harvest,   

Brother Ridge 



Sunday Sermons 
 Life of King David 

 Apr. 28  Hebrews 11:5-6  Pleasing God 
 May 5   Hebrews 11:7  Faith that Escapes 
 May 12   Hebrews 11:8-12  The Nitty-Gritty of  Faith 
 May 19   Hebrews 11:13-16  Desiring a Better Country 
 May 26   Hebrews 11:17-19  The Summit of  Faith 
 June 2   Hebrews 11:20-22  Dying Faith 
 June 9   Hebrews 11:23-26  Faith’s Choice 
 













Sunday, May 5, 10:45am–12pm 

Join us for our annual Outdoor Service! We'll have a time of 

worship & teaching out under the Bowen Pavilion, followed by 

a potluck! 

 

9:30a | Sunday School 

10:45a | Outdoor Service 

12:00p | Potluck  

Outdoor Service & Potluck 

Wednesday, May 1, 6 - 7:30pm  

Campfire and Cornhole Tournament 

Roasting hot dogs and s’mores over a fire and a           

cornhole tournament 

Our annual Summer Event Series, Summer Nights on the 

Lawn is back again this year! Join us on the first Wednesday 

of each month May thru August for a great fellowship event! 

 

 

 

June 17– June 21, 6:00 pm - 8:30pm  

We're going to Start the Party this Summer at VBS! Kids will enjoy a 

fun-filled time of music, crafts, outdoor games, & more! 

 

VBS at Memorial Baptist Church is free and open to children who 

are aged 3 + potty-trained thru completed 5th grade! 

 

More details & registration to come!  



 
Sunday Morning 

9:30 A.M. Bible Study 
 10:45 A.M. Worship 

Kids Worship 
 
 

Tuesdays 
7:00 A.M. Prayer Time  

  

Wednesdays 
        6:00 P.M.  Adult Bible Study  

KidMin 
Youth 

Ladies Bible Study 
     

 

*************  
Office Hours 

 

Monday - Thursday 

8:30 A.M. - 4:30 P.M. 

Friday 

8:30 A.M. - Noon 

1st Zach Welsh 

2nd Brain Tyler 

3rd Jet Adams 

4th Penny Reyes 

Bethani Watkins 

5th Haigan Burtchell 

6th Jay Bryant 

9th Maria Holleman 

Ka’Maryon Turner 

Abby Vest 

13th Allison Dunn 

Travis Teague 

14th Megan Clifton 

Terry Hamilton 

15th Karyn Foote 

18th Gladys Cobb 

Shiloh Jumper 

20th Landon Burtchell 

Jason Hancock 

22nd Robert Howe 

1st Summer Nights On the Lawn 

4th UMHB Spring Commencement 

5th Outdoor Service and Pot Luck Luncheon 

11th TC Commencement 

12th Mother’s Day 

14th Finance Meeting 

Deacon’s Meeting 

25th Feed My Sheep 

26th KidMin Family Hangout 

27th Memorial Day 

Church Office Closed 

23rd Maxine Legaspi 

24th Ruth Powell 

25th Michael Harris 

Justin O’Shea 

26th Melissa Hann 

Robyn Kirby 

Karen Owens 

27th Zaden Jurca 

31st Sarah Harris 


